
 
 

  

 

DEMA Professional Development Information and Specials 

 

1. Go Pro! From AOW to PADI Open Water Scuba Instructor! 

With your Advanced Open Water (AOW) certification, your next step is the 
Professional Rescue Course, which includes Emergency Oxygen and Emergency 
First Response training. After completing this, you'll be ready to pursue your 
Divemaster certification and can seamlessly transition into the Instructor 
Development Course (IDC). You can complete all these certifications with us at 
Rainbow Reef IDC in Key Largo, Florida. 

 

2. PADI Divemaster Course at Rainbow Reef Dive Center! 

Our 5-day Dive Master Program runs twice a month, allowing you to complete all 
requirements quickly, unlike other programs that can take months. With suƯicient 
business across our four Keys locations, you’ll be ready to start working as a 
Divemaster in no time. 

 

3. Unlimited Diving Program 

Don’t have the 40 dives to start the Divemaster course or 60 dives to be 
certified?  No problem.  Or, maybe you want to take the IDC, but do not have the 
required 100 dives to go to the Instructor Examination.  We can help you get your 
dive count up with the Unlimited Diving Program.  This is an opportunity where you 
can dive for an entire week with a boat dive in the morning and afternoon, plus night 



 
 

  

dives on Tuesday, Thursday and Saturday. That means you can get as many as 31 
dives in each week of Unlimited Diving.  This is open only to DM and IDC candidates 
who need dives. Housing is included. 

 

4. PADI Instructor Development Course at Rainbow Reef Dive Center! 

Our IDC is a 9-day program (12 days, including EFRI and IE) oƯered twice each 
month…yes, a new IDC starts every 2 weeks.  We are the most chosen CDC in the 
world, with 4 Course Directors actively teaching, and 6 on staƯ and more than 15 
Master Instructors and IDC StaƯ Instructors to assist.  We limit our class size to no 
more than 12 candidates, while always maintaining a 6:1 ratio.  We exclusively 
conduct the new format IDC, which includes the eLearning component.  

 

We also provide housing for all professional development students – our own 2 & 3 
bedroom apartments (women with women, men with men) with full kitchens, 
washer-dryers, dishwashers, Roku and Wi-Fi, located right next to our state-of-the-
art Training Center with its own 12’ deep pool with onsite tanks, banks & 
compressor…less than half a mile away are our 2 dockside dive centers that house 
our 8 boats – the largest dive fleet in Florida…the boats are on the Port Largo Canal 
which leads directly to the warm, clear waters of the FL Keys National Marine 
Sanctuary – the world’s third largest barrier reef and your other classroom! 

 

Here is our training calendar, and call us toll-free at 1-866-539-7432 or email at 
idc@rainbowreefidc.com  


